Attachment 1 -
Bid #919-13 Ford Trucks (7)

C.F250 XL SD  D.F250 XL SD E. F250 XL SD
A. F250 CNG (2) B. F250 SD CNG [Streets- with crane (2) with gate
Vendor [Streets] [Utilities-Electrical] Irrigation] [Water] [Fleet]

1. Frontier Ford $ 7161150 $ 49,165.88 $ 54,226.75 $ 81,203.50 $ 54,782.65
2. Fairview Ford No Bid $ 48,182.39 No Bid $ 79,365.14 $ 583,743.57
3. South Bay Ford $ 7199491 $ 50,262.73 $ 55,372.41 $ 83,910.31 $ 56,208.26
4. Fritts Ford $ 76,145.28 $ 49,911.13 $ 55,471.22 $ 82,676.56 $ 55,380.75
5. Raceway Ford $ 75,641.70 $ 50,117.14 $ 55,879.97 $ 82,739.78 $ 55,521.36
6. Villa Ford $ 73,18597 $ 49,567.26 No Bid $ 82,788.87 $ 55,491.41
7. Fairway Ford No Bid $ 49,955.79 No Bid $ 84,001.94 $ 56,043.44
8. Ford of Orange $ 7493496 $ 50,376.35 $ 59,761.25 $ 83,624.44 $ 55,854.69
9. Theodore Robins Ford No Bid $ 49,594.18 No Bid $ 83,376.81 $ 55,730.87



TOTAL
$ 125,838.25
$ 181,291.10



