Bid #932-13 Bulk Fuel Comparison

Discount/Mark Up Offered for Truck & Trailer Load

Vendor Name

87-octane unleaded gasoline
Based on 48,000 gallons

89-octane unleaded gasoline
Based on 36,000 gallons

10% Biodiesel
Based on 16,000

Total Cost of Mark Up or
Discount for 100,000 Gallons

Comments

gallons of Combined Fuel
-0.0340 -$0.0440 0.0150
IPC USA Lowest Bidder, however, doesn't
-$1,632.00 -$1,584.00 $240.00 -$2,976.00 meet specifications on diesel.
So. Counties Oil Co. 0.0090 -0.0110 0.0600
$432.00 -$396.00 $960.00 $996.00 Meets Specifications
Pinnacle Petroleum 0.0247 0.0180 0.0287
$1,185.60 $648.00 $459.20 $2,292.80 Doesn't meet specifications
Falcon Fuels. Inc. 0.0300 0.0300 0.0450
! $1,440.00 $1,080.00 $720.00 $3,240.00 Meets Specifications
Merrimac Energy Gp. 0.0390 0.0190 0.1100
$1,872.00 $684.00 $1,760.00 $4,316.00 Meets Specifications
Patten Energy 0.0900 0.0900
Enterprise $4,320.00 $3,240.00 No Bid $7,560.00 Incomplete Bid
Boyett Petroleum No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Petro Diamond No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dewitt Petroleum NO BId NO BId NO BIQ NO Bld No Bid




