
Attachment 1 -

Bid #917-13 Ford Vehicles (5)

Vendor Explorer Utility Interceptor (2) C-Max Energi (2)

1. South Bay Ford $26,313.37 $61,569.89 No Bid

2. Fairview Ford $26,491.39 $61,925.14 No Bid

3. Wondries Fleet Group $26,981.89 $63,507.82 $67,895.05

4. Raceway Ford $27,187.90 $62,594.40 No Bid

5. Frontier Ford $26,649.75 $62,237.50 No Bid

6. Villa Ford $27,155.56 $61,248.64 No Bid

7. North County Ford $27,001.00 $62,508.01 $65,997.99

8. Ford of Orange $26,901.89 $62,648.04 $69,336.28

9. Berge Ford $27,114.03 $62,623.24 No Bid


